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Fw: Finalized Contract : Consultancy for the Facilitation of a Business Funding Workshop
Series for Entrepreneurs Leading High Growth Potential Start-ups

Andre Austin <aaustin@dbankjm.com>
Wed 8/17/2022 09:58 AM

To: Christopher Sutherland <csutherland@dbankjm.com>

2 attachments (112 KB)
Banking info for contract.pdf; Outlook-1516637930.jpg;

Chris,

Please see attached Banking Details for the caption contract.

Regards

Mr. Andre' Austin 

Procurement Specialist - Access to Finance & BIGEE 
Project Management Office (PMO)

Ext: 4129; Direct : (876) 920-4840;
Fax: 960-2790
Email: aaustin@dbankjm.com

 

From: Winsome Leslie <winsome@devsolutionsmd.com>

Sent: Wednesday, August 17, 2022 09:35 AM

To: Andre Austin <aaustin@dbankjm.com>

Subject: Re: Finalized Contract : Consultancy for the Facilitation of a Business Funding Workshop Series for
Entrepreneurs Leading High Growth Potential Start-ups
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi Andre:

Please see attached.

Best,

Winsome

mailto:accesstofinance@dbankjm.com
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On Tue, Aug 16, 2022 at 5:07 PM Andre Austin <aaustin@dbankjm.com> wrote:

Dear Ms. Leslie,


Kindly provide your banking information for payments to be processed under the caption Contract


USD currency account of the Consultant: 
Financial Institution: 
Account Name:  
Account Number:  
Account Branch: 
Type of Account: 
(Provide any other relevant info. eg. RTGS) 


Thanks in Advance


Mr. Andre' Austin 

Procurement Specialist - Access to Finance & BIGEE 
Project Management Office (PMO)

Ext: 4129; Direct : (876) 920-4840;
Fax: 960-2790
Email: aaustin@dbankjm.com

1516637930865_Outlook-1515507703.jpg

 



From: Winsome Leslie <winsome@devsolutionsmd.com>

Sent: Tuesday, August 16, 2022 10:33 AM

To: Andre Austin <aaustin@dbankjm.com>

Cc: Nicholas Davis <NDavis@dbankjm.com>; Natalie D'Oyen <ndoyen@dbankjm.com>; Christopher Brown
<cbrown@dbankjm.com>; Adrian Nelson <anelson@dbankjm.com>

Subject: Re: Finalized Contract : Consultancy for the Facilitation of a Business Funding Workshop Series for
Entrepreneurs Leading High Growth Potential Start-ups
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.



Thank you.


Best,


Winsome


On Tue, Aug 16, 2022 at 10:14 AM Andre Austin <aaustin@dbankjm.com> wrote:


Dear Ms. Leslie,

Please see attached final contract .

Regards 

Mr. Andre' Austin 

Procurement Specialist - Access to Finance & BIGEE 
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Project Management Office (PMO)

Ext: 4129; Direct : (876) 920-4840;
Fax: 960-2790
Email: aaustin@dbankjm.com

 

From: Winsome Leslie <winsome@devsolutionsmd.com>

Sent: Monday, August 15, 2022 02:34 PM

To: Adrian Nelson <anelson@dbankjm.com>

Cc: Andre Austin <aaustin@dbankjm.com>; Nicholas Davis <NDavis@dbankjm.com>; Natalie D'Oyen
<ndoyen@dbankjm.com>; Christopher Brown <cbrown@dbankjm.com>

Subject: Re: Finalized Contract : Consultancy for the Facilitation of a Business Funding Workshop Series for
Entrepreneurs Leading High Growth Potential Start-ups
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Received and signed.  Please confirm receipt.

Thank you.

Best,

Winsome

On Mon, Aug 15, 2022 at 10:14 AM Adrian Nelson <anelson@dbankjm.com> wrote:

Dear Dr. Leslie,


The captioned contract should now be in your email for signing today, sent from the Legal
Department via Adobe. 


Best regards,
Adrian K. Nelson

Legal Officer

The Development Bank of Jamaica Ltd.
11a-15 Oxford Road
Kingston 5
Tel: (876) 929-4000 ext.4013


From: Winsome Leslie <winsome@devsolutionsmd.com>

Sent: Saturday, 13 August 2022 10:19 pm

To: Adrian Nelson <anelson@dbankjm.com>
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Cc: Andre Austin <aaustin@dbankjm.com>; Nicholas Davis <NDavis@dbankjm.com>; Natalie D'Oyen
<ndoyen@dbankjm.com>; Christopher Brown <cbrown@dbankjm.com>

Subject: Re: Final Contract : Consultancy for the Facilitation of a Business Funding Workshop Series for
Entrepreneurs Leading High Growth Potential Start-ups
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.



Thank you Adrian.


Best,


Winsome



Winsome Leslie
President & CEO
DevSolutions Consulting, LLC
www.devsolutionsmd.com



On Aug 13, 2022, at 3:26 PM, Adrian Nelson <anelson@dbankjm.com> wrote:




﻿
Dear Dr. Leslie,


The contract will be re-sent to you between now and Monday morning. We had to
recall it to change the date to Monday's which is why you are seeing the cancelled
error message. I will email you when it has been re-sent.


Best regards,
Adrian K. Nelson


Get Outlook for Android



From: Winsome Leslie <winsome@devsolutionsmd.com>

Sent: Saturday, August 13, 2022, 11:05 AM

To: Adrian Nelson

Cc: Andre Austin; Nicholas  Davis; Natalie D'Oyen; Christopher Brown

Subject: Re: Final Contract : Consultancy for the Facilitation of a Business Funding
Workshop Series for Entrepreneurs Leading High Growth Potential Start-ups



CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open
attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.



Dear Andre:


I tried to sign the contract.   When I click on "Review and Sign", I get an error mesage saying that
the Agreement has been cancelled.  Please advise.
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Thank you.


Regards,


Winsome






On Fri, Aug 12, 2022 at 5:17 PM Adrian Nelson <anelson@dbankjm.com> wrote:


Dear Dr. Leslie,

We will resend the contract for signing by/on Monday Aug.15, 2022. 

Best regards,
Adrian K. Nelson
Legal Officer
DBJ

Get Outlook for Android

-- 


Winsome Leslie, Ph.D.
CEO & Founder
DevSolutions Consulting, LLC.
www.devsolutionsmd.com
Tel: 410-844-1933





-- 



Winsome Leslie, Ph.D.
CEO & Founder
DevSolutions Consulting, LLC.
www.devsolutionsmd.com
Tel: 410-844-1933
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-- 


Winsome Leslie, Ph.D.
CEO & Founder
DevSolutions Consulting, LLC.
www.devsolutionsmd.com
Tel: 410-844-1933
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